
 

USING POTABLE WATER AT 

SEAVIEW MARINA 
We are pleased to provide convenient access to clean, potable water at all our berths. 
This guide will help you make the best use of our water facilities during your stay. 

Location of Taps 

Each berth is fitted with a water 
tap usually positioned on the 
power pedestal 

Connecting Your Hose 

Please use a food-grade hose to 
protect water quality. Ensure 
connections are tight to avoid 
leaks and use a trigger nozzle to 
conserve water 

ACCESSING POTABLE WATER 

Conserve Water 

Use water efficiently and avoid 
wastage to help protect our 
environment  

Hose Maintenance  

Disconnect your hose after use 
to prevent damage and reduce 
trip hazards along the pontoons 

Report Leaks 

Notify the Marina Office 
immediately if you notice any 
leaks or issues with taps  

USAGE GUIDELINES 

HEALTH AND SAFETY 

Regular Testing 

Our potable water supply is 
tested regularly to meet health 
and safety standards 

Hygiene 

Wash your hands after handling 
hoses and taps to maintain 
personal hygiene 

ENVIRONMENTAL CONSIDERATIONS 

Avoid Contamination 

Do not use hoses to rinse off 
harmful chemicals or 
pollutants in the harbour 

 

Spill Response 

In case of any spills, notify 
Marina Staff right away to 
initiate proper cleanup 
procedures 


